
 

 

Investors poised for diverging EU/US policies 
 
Investors have opted for European government bonds in favour of US treasuries in anticipation of 
diverging monetary policies, which may pose challenges to the US economy. 
 

 US treasury 2-yr yields highest seen since April 2011, continue to diverge with bunds 

 ETFs tracking US treasuries have seen $1.7bn of outflows in the first week of November  

 Short end of the US treasury curve is at its flattest since April 
 
Hawkish comments from Fed chairman Janet 
Yellen yesterday preceded a selloff in US 
treasuries, as market expectations of an 
inaugural rate hike in December rose in 
tandem.  
 

 
 
2-yr US treasury yields, seen as the most 
sensitive to short term interest rates, rose to 
0.84% according to Markit’s bond pricing 
service. This was the highest level since April 
2011; just before the Fed concluded its 
second round of QE. 
 
Yesterday’s comments added to the hawkish 
tones set out in October’s FOMC meeting, in 
which the official statement cited diminishing 
downside risks to the US economy. But while 
US sentiment is swaying towards an 
imminent rate rise, counterparts in Europe 
have taken the opposite view. Grappling with 
low inflation, last month the ECB raised the 
possibility of expanding its current QE 
programme while also cutting deposit rates. 
2-yr German bund yields collapsed to their 
lowest ever levels, currently -0.34%. The 

dovish sentiment was matched today by the 
UK, whose central bank looks to have sided 
with Europe. 
 
The diverging policies with it challenges, 
especially for the US, where an already 
strong dollar could present further problems. 
The US and Europe remain major trading 
partners, and a stronger dollar has the 
potential to import deflation as well as posing 
currency risks for US multinational firms 
exposed to the euro. 
 
Investors anticipate divergence 

 
 
The prospect of further deviation between 
European and US government bond yields 
has already been picked up by ETF investors. 
According to Markit’s ETP analytics service, 
ETFs tracking US treasuries have seen four 
consecutive weeks of outflows for the first 
time since June. The trend has gained further 
traction on the back of the Fed’s recent 
hawkish comments, with the first five days in 
November already seeing $1.7bn of net 
outflows; surpassing the whole of October’s 

-1

0

1

1

2

2

3

Jan/10 Jan/11 Jan/12 Jan/13 Jan/14 Jan/15

2-yr government bond yield

Germany US

Source: Markit

%

Source: Markit

-3

-2

-1

0

1

2

3

4

5

6

Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov

Government bond ETFs inflows/outflows ($Bn)

US Treasuries

Eurozone Government

Source: Markit

Markit Commentary 

November 5
th
 2015 

https://www.google.co.uk/url?sa=t&rct=j&q=&esrc=s&source=web&cd=2&cad=rja&uact=8&ved=0CCUQFjABahUKEwiRwrfozfnIAhUkl3IKHfIhAo4&url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.markit.com%2FProduct%2FETP&usg=AFQjCNFTtP8rPaoahU8QjlKZ88TqhBtqnw&sig2=Fsk6vQj7HxnLsR5cBnxwRw&bvm=bv.106674449,bs.1,d.bGQ
https://www.google.co.uk/url?sa=t&rct=j&q=&esrc=s&source=web&cd=1&cad=rja&uact=8&ved=0CB8QFjAAahUKEwiG69TazfnIAhUIvXIKHUkGBOw&url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.markit.com%2FProduct%2FPricing-Data-Bonds&usg=AFQjCNE4KWlKR204XRqfFPV76_6fq8vc-A&sig2=jBJbwCI-IXRI_Xc976W51A&bvm=bv.106674449,bs.1,d.bGQ
https://www.google.co.uk/url?sa=t&rct=j&q=&esrc=s&source=web&cd=1&cad=rja&uact=8&ved=0CB8QFjAAahUKEwiG69TazfnIAhUIvXIKHUkGBOw&url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.markit.com%2FProduct%2FPricing-Data-Bonds&usg=AFQjCNE4KWlKR204XRqfFPV76_6fq8vc-A&sig2=jBJbwCI-IXRI_Xc976W51A&bvm=bv.106674449,bs.1,d.bGQ
https://www.google.co.uk/url?sa=t&rct=j&q=&esrc=s&source=web&cd=2&cad=rja&uact=8&ved=0CCUQFjABahUKEwiRwrfozfnIAhUkl3IKHfIhAo4&url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.markit.com%2FProduct%2FETP&usg=AFQjCNFTtP8rPaoahU8QjlKZ88TqhBtqnw&sig2=Fsk6vQj7HxnLsR5cBnxwRw&bvm=bv.106674449,bs.1,d.bGQ


 
Markit Fixed Income Research 

   

net outflows. In contrast, ETFs tracking 
eurozone government bonds have continued 
to see positive inflows as investors attempt to 
front run the ECB’s rhetoric. 
 
Treasury curve flattens

 
The recent march in 2-yr US treasury yields 
has also done much to flatten the short end of 
US treasury curve, with 10s2s (difference 
between 10-yr and 2-yr rates) at its lowest 
level since April. A flatter treasury curve 
poses risks especially to the banking sector 
as margins are squeezed, which could lead to 
potential spill over into the wider economy. 
Flat yield curves have also been a precursor 
to impending recessions – yet another risk 
which the Fed needs to address as it moves 
to normalise interest rates. 
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