
 

 

 

Most shorted ahead of earnings   

 
A review of how short sellers are positioning themselves in stocks ahead of earnings 
announcements in the coming week. 
 

 Retailers and oil & gas helicopter charter the most shorted in North America 

 Short sellers doubt fairly robust results expected from Coca Cola Hellenic 

 Sanrio’s Hello Kitty retains position as the most shorted in Apac ahead of earnings 
 

North America 

 
 
A refreshing week ahead as the only oil & gas 
firm occupying the top twenty North America 
is Bristow Group with currently has 11% of 
shares outstanding on loan. The firm provides 
helicopter charter services to oil & gas majors 
around the world.  
 

 
 

 
Most shorted this week in North America is 
Hibbett Sports, a sporting goods retailing 
chain. The retailer has 17% of shares 
outstanding on loan, having recently jumped 
by 27% in the last month. Consensus 
forecasts point to robust sales for the fiscal 
year for HIbbett but operating profits are 
expected to be flat. Absent of any major 
announcements, short sellers may be 
expecting earnings to disappoint. 
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Second most shorted ahead of earnings is 
Bon-Ton Stores with 16.8% of shares 
outstanding on loan. The retail department 
store owner and operator sells apparel, 
accessories, cosmetics and furniture. Since 
2010 the firm’s sales have stagnated with the 
firm posting four consecutive years of net 
losses. Consensus forecasts expect these 
losses to continue despite forecasts for a 
strong earnings from the holiday trading 
quarter over 2014/2015.  
 
Western Europe 

 
 
Facilities management, care provider and 
outsourcing firm Mitie Group, is the most 
shorted in Europe ahead of earnings with 
8.9% of shares outstanding on loan. The 
company is facing allegations, levelled this 
week, that it has not been paying care worker 
staff the minimum wage. News prompted a 
sharp sell off in shares.  
 

 
 
Short sellers in Zoopla have retreated 30% in 
the last week as the stock moved 9% higher. 
Shares outstanding on loan have fallen to 
3.6% after reaching highs above 5% after 
steadily rising on concerns on the impact of 
new entrant; On the Market.   
 

 
 
Shares in Coca Cola Hellenic have rallied 
since February despite the company’s 
exposure to Greece. The company released a 
trading statement expecting single digit 
growth in the fragile economy. Short sellers 
however do not seem convinced, with shares 
outstanding on loan increasing by 26% to 
3.3% while the share price has increased 
31% since the beginning of January 2015. 
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http://www.bbc.co.uk/news/business-32715728
http://www.markit.com/Commentary/Get/05022015-Equities-The-Rightmove-in-a-game-of-digital-duopoly
http://www.ft.com/fastft/323922
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Asia Pacific  

 
 
Sanrio retains its position as the most 
shorted stock in Apac ahead of earnings. 
 

 
 
The character goods and merchandise 
manufacturer, most well-known as the Hello 
Kitty brand, has seen a modest decline in 
shares outstanding on in the past month to 
12.6%.  
 

 

Solar sell manufacturer Gintech Energy is the 
second most shorted in Apac ahead of 
earnings, with 7.5% of shares outstanding on 
loan. Shares in the company have continued 
to slide over the last 12 months, declining 
45%. Short interest has declined in the last 
three months by 23%. Consensus earnings 
forecasts expect the company to post its 
largest loss per share since FY11.  

 

Beijing based, and not to be confused with 
King Digital, Kingsoft develops a wide range 
of software and applications. Shares in the 
company have increased by 72% since the 
end of February accompanied with a 46% 
increase in shares outstanding on loan to 
8.5%.  
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